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T R A I N I N G  A C A D E M Y

ELEVATING BEAUTY STANDARDS, ONE ARTIST AT A TIME



Course Catalogue
Lash

Brows

CLASSIC EYELASH EXTENSION COURSE

RUSSIAN EYELASH EXTENSION COURSE

SIGNATURE EYEBROW COURSE

EYEBROW LAMINATION COURSE

FAST TARCK EYEBROW COURSE

Without Kit £249 - With Kit £349

FAST TRACK EYELASH EXTENSION COURSE

LASH LIFT AND TINT COURSE

Without Kit £249 - With Kit £329

Without Kit £448 - With Kit £598

Without Kit £199 - With Kit £309

Without Kit £199 - With Kit £399

Without Kit £199 - With Kit £439

Without Kit £348 - With Kit £588



At K Beauty Academy, we are committed to elevating beauty
standards and ensuring every student receives the highest quality
education. Our lead educator, Karis, has over eight years of industry
experience and has been teaching for the past five years. She founded
the academy with one goal in mind—to raise the standard of beauty
training in her local area. What started as a small academy quickly
gained recognition, attracting students from London and even Dublin,
all eager to learn from her expertise.

Karis initially taught small group classes of four students but soon
discovered that 1-2-1 training allowed her to provide a more tailored
learning experience. This shift resulted in a remarkable improvement in
her students' work, and now, with over 150 successful students, her
reputation speaks for itself. 

Many students return for additional courses, a testament to the
academy’s high-quality training and supportive learning environment.

What truly sets us apart is our lifetime support. We understand that
starting a career in beauty can be daunting, and we want to ensure you
never feel lost. Karis is dedicated to guiding you every step of the way,
long after you’ve completed your training.

At our cosy, home-based salon, we offer a chilled, relaxed, and non-
judgmental space where you can learn at your own pace. Our courses
are packed with valuable industry knowledge, so if you're planning to
train with us, be sure to bring a pen—you’ll leave with more than just a
certificate; you’ll leave with the skills and confidence to excel in your
career.

Why us?



Regularly Updated Manuals

1-2-1 Focused Training

Lunch & Drinks Included

Live Model Practice

3.
4.

6.
5.

Gain a recognised qualification to start your career with
confidence.

Get personalised guidance tailored to your learning style.

Stay refreshed and focused with complimentary lunch and drinks
throughout the day.

Perfect your skills with hands-on experience on real models in a
supportive setting.

Still Need Reassurance?
Here Are Some Unique Benefits We Offer at Our Academy!

If You Decide to Train with Us
Please let us know your desired training course and preferred month to
train, and we’ll get back to you with available dates. 

2.
1.

ABT Accredited

Our training materials are updated every 6 months to keep up with
industry trends.

Lifetime Support

We don’t just train you and send you off, we offer ongoing support
throughout your career.

7.
Professional Content Creation

We’ll capture high-quality photos of you working on a camera and edit
them for you, so you have stunning content ready to advertise your
work.


